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Clothing Alteration Service In Glasgow

The Zip Yard Glasgow - Glasgow
   
The Zip Yard Glasgow: Your Go-To Clothing Alteration Service

  When it comes to clothing alterations, The Zip Yard in Glasgow stands out for
its exceptional **accessibility** and efficient service options. Whether you need
a simple hem, a complex redesign, or on-site repairs, this local gem caters to a
wide array of needs.  

Accessibility Features

  One of the most notable aspects of The Zip Yard is its commitment to
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**accessibility**. With a **wheelchair-accessible entrance**, customers can
easily access the store without barriers. This thoughtful feature ensures that
everyone can benefit from their high-quality alteration services.  

On-Site Services That Impress

  The Zip Yard is renowned for its quick and efficient **on-site services**. Many
customers have praised the speed at which their alterations are completed. For
instance, one patron mentioned how they had a bag button fixed within just five
minutes, while another customer commended staff for promptly addressing
issues with a dress just two weeks before a wedding.  With testimonials
highlighting the professionalism and friendliness of the staff, it’s clear why The
Zip Yard has garnered such a positive reputation. Customers frequently leave
pleased with the results, describing the work as “original,” “expert,” and even
“better than expected.”  

Customer Experiences

  While most experiences at The Zip Yard are overwhelmingly positive, some
patrons have shared mixed feedback regarding various alterations. A few
customers reported dissatisfaction with the quality of work on more complex
tasks, such as altering leather jackets or specific dress fittings. Yet, many
emphasized that the friendly and helpful nature of the staff often mitigated any
dissatisfaction.  For example, one customer shared a heartwarming story about
how the team went above and beyond to repair a damaged dress, ensuring it
was perfect for a special occasion. Such instances illustrate that while
challenges may arise, The Zip Yard's staff are dedicated to customer
satisfaction.  

Final Thoughts

  The Zip Yard Glasgow not only meets the practical needs of its clientele
through **accessible** and efficient services but also excels in creating a
welcoming environment. Whether you're looking for minor adjustments or
significant alterations, this service is worth considering. With a mix of positive
experiences and constructive feedback, The Zip Yard remains a reliable choice
for clothing alterations in Glasgow.   If you find yourself in need of alterations,
don't hesitate to visit The Zip Yard. Their combination of quality work,
accessibility, and customer-oriented service could be just what you’re looking
for!    
Our business is found at

  
 611 Great Western Rd, G12 8HX  Glasgow,  - United Kingdom  (GB) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of this Clothing alteration service  is +441412865821
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+441412865821
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=55.876427%2C-4.2856239#map=15/55.876427/-4.2856239
tel:+441412865821
https://wa.me/+598+441412865821


 
    
 
   
    
 

Our public attention hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–5:30?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–5:30?PM   Wednesday 9?AM–5:30?PM   Thursday 10?AM–4?PM   Friday Closed   Saturday 9?AM–5:30?PM   Sunday 9?AM–5:30?PM        The website is The Zip Yard Glasgow       If you need to change any element that you feel is not correct concerning
this page, we ask send a message so that we will fix it as soon as possible.
Thanks beforehand thank you very much. 
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