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Supermarket In Loanhead

Asda Straiton Superstore - Loanhead
   
Exploring Asda Straiton Superstore: A Comprehensive Review

  Asda Straiton Superstore, located in Loanhead, offers a variety of **offerings**
that cater to the needs of local shoppers. With a diverse range of food products,
household items, and clothing, there’s something for everyone at this
supermarket. Let's dive deep into what makes this store unique and some areas
where it could improve.  

Store Highlights and Accessibility

  One of the key *highlights* of Asda Straiton Superstore is its
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**wheelchair-accessible entrance** and **wheelchair-accessible car park**. This
ensures that individuals with disabilities can shop comfortably. **Free parking**
options, including **free of charge street parking**, are also available, making it
convenient for shoppers.   However, customers have pointed out that finding a
good selection of **great produce** can be challenging due to shelves often
appearing empty or poorly stocked. Many have raised concerns about **metal
cans** and other items being frequently out of stock, which detracts from the
shopping experience.  

Shopping Experience: In-Store Insights

  Inside the store, you’ll find a traditional layout that includes all major grocery
sections—**frozen and chilled foods**, **fresh produce**, and even a dedicated
area for **pet foods** and **alcohol**. Some customers appreciate the **quick
visit** service when picking up pre-ordered items through **in-store pick-up**.
However, feedback indicates that the overall organization can be improved, as
gaps in stock and untidy aisles have been reported during peak hours. 
Checkout service is generally recognized as **fast and friendly**, but issues with
staff responsiveness at **self-checkouts** have also surfaced. Customers have
noted long wait times for assistance, particularly when technology does not work
seamlessly.  

Payment Options and Customer Service

  Asda Straiton accommodates various payment methods including **credit
cards** and **NFC mobile payments**. Unfortunately, customer service
experiences vary considerably. While some shoppers highlight **kind and
helpful staff** like Fiona and Jonathan, others report encountering rudeness
from personnel, especially during busy shifts.  A notable point of concern has
been the inconsistency in quality, particularly regarding stale bread and
outdated items. Customers are encouraged to check expiration dates diligently,
as the store sometimes stocks goods past their **best before** dates.  

Sustainable Practices and Community Engagement

  An emerging focus for supermarkets worldwide is sustainability. At Asda
Straiton, customers are encouraged to participate in **recycling** efforts,
particularly concerning **glass bottles** and **batteries**. Engaging the local
community in sustainable practices enhances the store's reputation, though
improvements in this area continue to be suggested.  

Delivery Services and Online Shopping

  For those who prefer shopping from home, Asda offers **delivery** services
and **no-contact delivery** options. However, there have been mixed reviews
about the reliability of these services. Customers have voiced frustrations when
delivery expectations are not met, emphasizing the need for better
communication regarding order status.  Shopping online through the Click &
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Collect service is another popular option, allowing customers to order groceries
ahead of time and pick them up conveniently.  

Conclusion

  In summary, Asda Straiton Superstore provides a wide array of products and
services aimed at fulfilling the needs of its shoppers. While the availability of
**great produce** and overall cleanliness of the store receive mixed reviews, its
commitment to accessibility and its extensive range of offerings remain
commendable. Continued focus on improving customer service, stock
management, and sustainability will only enhance the shopping experience for
everyone.    
Our business is found at

  
 Pentland Rd, EH20 9NY  Loanhead,  - United Kingdom  (GB) 
 
     
 
The phone number of the mentioned Supermarket  is +441314651500
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+441314651500
 
    
 
   
    
 

Our opening hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday Open 24 hours   Tuesday Open 24 hours   Wednesday Open 24 hours   Thursday Open 24 hours   Friday Open 24 hours   Saturday Open 24 hours   Sunday Open 24 hours        The website is Asda Straiton Superstore       If you wish to update any information that you believe is not correct
concerning this site, we urge you to send a message so that we will correct it
quickly. Thank you in advance thanks for your cooperation. 
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